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The security of our people should be the utmost 
responsibility of the government. We expect the ruling 
regime to take concrete steps to restore normalcy in 
Manipur. — Memorandum submitted by Congress dele-
gation chaired by Shri Mallikarjun Kharge ji to the hon-

ourable President of India.
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PATNA:CONGRESS DARPAN 

This is the era of staying in 
power while diverting the 
attention of the general public. 
This is the era to keep smiling 
even while destroying the her-
itage of the country. This is an 
age of crafty phrases and 
senseless definitions. This is 
not Amrit Kaal but Modi—Amit 
Kaal. 

In which the meaning of 
power and budget is also 
changing. In which, instead of 
giving an account of the old 
schemes, the public has been 
confused and ordered to look 
at the new posters and that too 
when everyone knows that 
tomorrow these new posters 
will be torn down and new 
posters will be put up again. 

Such time will be spent by 
the government and the public 
will feel that development is 
taking place. While the reality 
is that this is not the time to 
celebrate Amrit Mahotsav but 
to do serious contemplation. 
Which seems more important 
looking at this time's budget. 

In this budget, the govern-
ment has cleverly presented 
the vision of the next 25 years. 
In fact, through this, the gov-
ernment has tried to create 
such an atmosphere that if any 
intellectual public questions 
the government about the pre-
sent, then the government will 
give a tingle after 25 years in 
its answer. 

While presenting the bud-
get, the government forgot 
that it is the year 2022. By the 
year by which the income of 
the farmers was to be doubled 
as per the announcement of 
Modi ji. Six crore houses were 
to be built in the cities and vil-
lages. Under the PM Kusum 
scheme, 20 lakh solar pumps 
were to be distributed. About 
1.5 lakh wellness centers were 
to be established. But the real 
situation this year is that 80 
crore people have no money, 
no food grains and no employ-
ment. 

But instead of putting the 
real situation of the country in 
front of the public in the form 
of a responsible government, 
the government has opened a 
new bundle of dreams. Which 
sounds very attractive, but if 
we consider the ground level, 
then it is known that those 
dreams have no real basis of 

their own. 
To make it more clear, we 

can consider the announce-
ment of bringing digital curren-
cy of the government. This 
announcement is very vague 
and at the same time practical. 
Because 70% of the country's 
population resides in villages 
and the literacy rate of the 
country is also only 78%, in 
such a situation, the govern-
ment is not clear about the 
expansion of digital currency. 
Along with this, in this context, 
even if we talk about only 
urban areas, at present, India 
is struggling badly with online 
fraud. The government system 
is not strong enough to get rid 
of it. In such a situation, when 
even normal online banking 
transactions are not complete-
ly secure, the introduction of 
digital currency itself seems to 
be a rush and an attempt to 
divert public attention. 

Similarly, if we consider the 
field of education, the govern-
ment has announced that it 
will open a virtual university, 
as well as the E—Vidya 
scheme will also be expanded. 
But the biggest question here 
is that in a country like India, 
where ten crore families are 
living without TV and mobile, 
are suffering from extreme 
poverty, how will the technolo-
gy be transferred to them. The 
government's emphasis on 
online education somewhere 
shows indifference and sensi-
tivity towards the future of the 
poor. 

In one sentence, instead of 
creating trust, the government 
creates fear for the future of 
the country. 

 
Ekta Kumari  
Columnist & Teacher 
Delhi University

It is not Amrit Kaal 
but Modi-Amit Kaal ?
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Water Resources Department held a meeting with high level officials today at Vikas Soudha.  It was suggested to complete the 
remaining irrigation schemes in the state as soon as possible after making financial mobilization. 

 A separate advisory committee is being formed to find out the possible corruption and lapses in the works done in the past, 
and it has been suggested to complete the irrigation projects without compromising on the quality. 

 Discipline and transparency are being given first priority in the department.  Mainly more emphasis has to be given on job cre-
ation.  For this plans have to be prepared in private partnership.  He said that efforts should be made continuously to save the 
trust reposed by the people in the state government.

Daman and Diu, an important part of India, was once administered 

as a part of Goa. Since 1987, it has been a separate union territory. 

A coastal town on the Arabian Sea, famous for unpolluted blue 

waters and golden sand, is now engraved as a strategic and attrac-

tive destination on Indials map.

Heartfelt Greetings to the people of Goa on their Statehood Day. 

Goa, known for its beaches and medieval architecture, became a 

full—fledged state within the Indian Union under PM Rajiv Gandhi. 

Today we celebrate the culture, ecosystem, and contribution of 

Goa towards Indials recognition and progress.
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Er Mohiuddin khan 

 
Top wrestlers reached 

Haridwar to immerse their 
medals in the Ganga river in 
protest against wrestling fed-
eration chief Brij Bhushan 
Sharan Singh Farmer leader 
Rakesh Tikait also said that he 
is travelling to Haridwar to 
extend his support to the 
wrestlers and has urged them 
not to immerse their medals in 
the Ganga river. 

The country's top wrestlers, 
who were detained by Delhi 
Police and removed from their 
Jantar Mantar protest site, on 
Tuesday reached Haridwar to 
immerse their medals in river 
Ganga as a mark of protest 
against WFI chief and BJP MP 

Brij Bhushan Sharan Singh 
over sexual harassment alle-
gations A huge crowd gath-
ered around  wrestlers in 
Haridwar,  Earlier in the day, 
Sakshi Malik, a bronze medal-
list at the 2016 Rio Olympics, 
took to Twitter to say that they 
will immerse the medals in the 
holy river at 6 pm.2016 Rio 

Olympics, took to Twitter to 
say that they will immerse the 
medals in the holy river at 6 
pm. "These medals are our life 
and soul. We are going to 
immerse them in the Ganges 
because she is Maa Ganga. 
After that, there is no point of 
living, so we will sit on a 
hunger strike until death at 
India Gate," 

visuals from Haridwar 
showed wrestlers Vinesh 
Phogat, Sakshi Malik, Bajrang 
Punia surrounded by support-
ers, in tears, slumped to the 
ground before immersing their 
medals in a mark of protest. 

I said to  you all protesting 
wrestlers that you got these 
awards through hard work and 
not due to any kindness by 
BJP MP Brij Bhushan Sharan 
Singh. 

These medals are the coun-
try's honours. These medals 
have not come by any act of 
kindness by BJP MP Brij 
Bhushan Sharan Singh. The 
sportspersons won it through 
their hard work,"The govern-
ment has repeatedly insulted 
sportspersons and daughters. 
Similar behaviour was meted 
out to them during the inaugu-
ration of the new Parliament 
building. The sportspersons 
are going to immerse their 
medals in the Ganga in 
Haridwar. People are extreme-
ly sad about it. I would appeal 
to the sportspersons to not do 
this,Nine years, country in 
misery. The Modi government 
has disappointed the people of 
the country. It has not been 
able to fulfil its promises made 
to the country."

Wrestlers in tears after 
reaching Haridwar to throw 
their All medals in Ganga?


